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Waffle House, Inc. Summer Internship Program for
Students
Description
Step into a world of breakfast brilliance, where golden-brown masterpieces are
crafted with love and devotion. Welcome to Waffle House, Inc. in Norcross – a
haven for lovers of scrumptious waffles and hearty Southern hospitality. Discover
the unconventional charms of this beloved establishment as we delve into its
captivating essence, from the bustling atmosphere to the mouthwatering delights
that await.

Immerse yourself in the lively ambiance that defines Waffle House, Inc. in Norcross.
This iconic eatery is renowned for its bustling environment, where the clatter of
plates, laughter of patrons, and aroma of sizzling bacon harmonize to create an
unforgettable dining experience. Be part of the vibrant tapestry that weaves through
each day, as you contribute to the legacy of exceptional service and delicious food.

Responsibilities
As a member of the Waffle House, Inc. family, your responsibilities will span across
various domains. From expertly flipping fluffy pancakes and preparing
mouthwatering omelets to providing top-notch customer service, you will be an
integral part of the team that keeps the griddles sizzling and the customers smiling.
Adaptability, multitasking prowess, and a passion for culinary artistry are key
qualities that will help you thrive in this fast-paced environment.

Qualifications
While a formal culinary education is not a requirement, a genuine love for food and a
dedication to creating delightful dining experiences is essential. At Waffle House,
Inc., we embrace individuals from diverse backgrounds who possess a strong work
ethic, a positive attitude, and a willingness to learn. Bring your enthusiasm to the
table, and we will provide the training and support necessary for you to excel.

Experience
Whether you are a seasoned professional or embarking on your first culinary
adventure, Waffle House, Inc. welcomes individuals with varying levels of
experience. If you have previously dabbled in the culinary arts or have honed your
customer service skills in a fast-paced environment, your expertise will be valued.
However, we believe that true potential lies within one’s willingness to grow and
evolve, and we are excited to nurture your talents along the way.

Skills
At Waffle House, Inc., we value a range of skills that contribute to the overall
success of our team. Apart from culinary aptitude and exceptional customer service
skills, effective communication, teamwork, and the ability to remain calm under
pressure are highly regarded attributes. A willingness to go the extra mile and a
knack for problem-solving will ensure you consistently deliver memorable
experiences to our cherished patrons.

Job Benefits
Joining the Waffle House, Inc. family comes with its fair share of delectable benefits.

Hiring organization
Waffle House, Inc.

Employment Type
Intern

Duration of employment
6 months

Industry
Restaurants

Job Location
Norcross, Georgia, USA, 30003,
Norcross, Georgia, USA

Working Hours
8

Base Salary
10
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September 23, 2024

Valid through
30.05.2026
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Enjoy flexible scheduling options that accommodate your lifestyle, allowing you to
find the perfect balance between work and personal commitments. Competitive pay,
opportunities for advancement, and a supportive work environment are just a few of
the ingredients that make this an enticing career choice. Additionally, the
friendships you forge and the memories you create will be cherished for a lifetime.

Contacts
If you’re ready to embark on an extraordinary adventure with Waffle House, Inc. in
Norcross, we invite you to take the first step. Visit our website at
www.wafflehousenorcrosscareers.com to explore current job openings and submit
your application. For any further inquiries, please feel free to reach out to our
recruitment team at careers@wafflehousenorcross.com. We look forward to
welcoming you to the Waffle

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

Waffle House, Inc. https://www.hirings24.online

http://www.wafflehousenorcrosscareers.com/
mailto:careers@wafflehousenorcross.com
http://www.tcpdf.org

