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Jack in the Box Summer Internship Program 2025
For UnderGraduates
Description
Looking for a dynamic and exciting internship opportunity in San Diego? Look no
further than Jack in the Box! Our fast-paced and innovative company is seeking
motivated interns to join our team and contribute to our ongoing success. In this
blog post, we’ll dive into the details of what you can expect as a Jack in the Box
intern.

As a Jack in the Box intern, you’ll have the opportunity to gain hands-on experience
in the fast food industry while working with a team of professionals who are
passionate about what they do. You’ll be a vital part of the company’s daily
operations, working in various departments to gain a comprehensive understanding
of how our business works.

Responsibilities
Your responsibilities as an intern will vary depending on the department you’re
working in, but you can expect to assist with a variety of tasks that support the
company’s goals. This may include conducting market research, helping to develop
marketing campaigns, assisting with social media management, participating in
product development meetings, and more.

Qualifications
We’re looking for interns who are self-motivated, driven, and eager to learn. To be
considered for this internship, you must be currently enrolled in a college or
university program and have a GPA of 3.0 or higher. You should also have strong
communication and organizational skills, as well as a positive attitude and
willingness to take on new challenges.

Experience
While previous experience in the fast food industry is not required, it is certainly a
plus. We’re looking for interns who have a demonstrated interest in the industry and
are eager to learn more about it. Any previous experience you have in marketing,
social media management, or market research will also be helpful.

Skills
To succeed in this internship, you’ll need a variety of skills, including excellent
communication and interpersonal abilities, strong organizational skills, and the
ability to work independently as well as part of a team. You should also be proficient
in Microsoft Office, have strong analytical skills, and be comfortable working with
data.

Job Benefits
As a Jack in the Box intern, you’ll have the opportunity to gain valuable hands-on
experience in the fast food industry. You’ll work with a team of professionals who
are passionate about what they do, and you’ll be able to make a meaningful
contribution to the company’s success. In addition, you’ll receive a competitive
salary and may be eligible for academic credit.

Hiring organization
Jack in the Box

Employment Type
Intern

Duration of employment
6 months

Industry
Restaurants

Job Location
San Diego, California, USA, 91911,
San Diego, California, USA

Working Hours
8

Base Salary
10

Date posted
December 6, 2024

Valid through
03.05.2026
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Contacts

Ready to apply for an internship with Jack in the Box? Visit our website to learn
more about our current opportunities and to submit your application. If you have any
questions about the internship program or the application process, please contact
us at internships@jackinthebox.com. We look forward to hearing from you!
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