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Internships 2025
Description
If you’re a high school student looking to gain valuable work experience in the
technology industry, then HP’s Print High School Internships in Linthicum Heights
might be the perfect opportunity for you. This program offers an exciting chance to
work with industry professionals and build your skills in a real-world setting. Here’s
everything you need to know about the program.

The HP Print High School Internship Program is designed to provide high school
students with hands-on experience in the technology industry. This summer
program is based in Linthicum Heights, Maryland, and offers students the
opportunity to work with a team of experienced professionals in the field.

Responsibilities
As an intern in the HP Print High School Internship Program, you will be responsible
for assisting the team in a variety of tasks. This may include shadowing team
members, working on projects, attending meetings, and learning about the industry.
You will also be expected to complete assigned tasks and projects within a given
timeframe.

Qualifications
To be eligible for the HP Print High School Internship Program, you must be a high
school student who is at least 16 years of age. You must also have a minimum GPA
of 3.0 and be able to provide proof of enrollment in a high school or GED program.

Experience
While prior work experience is not required, it is recommended that you have some
familiarity with technology and an interest in the industry. This can include
coursework in computer science or other related fields, participation in technology
clubs or competitions, or personal projects that demonstrate your skills and
interests.

Skills
To succeed in the HP Print High School Internship Program, you should possess
strong communication, teamwork, and time management skills. You should also be
willing to learn new skills and take on new challenges as they arise. Some technical
skills, such as familiarity with Microsoft Office or Adobe Creative Suite, may also be
helpful.

Job Benefits
As an intern in the HP Print High School Internship Program, you will gain valuable
work experience and build your skills in the technology industry. You will also have
the opportunity to network with industry professionals and learn about career
opportunities in the field. Additionally, you will receive a stipend to help cover
expenses related to the program.

Contacts

Hiring organization
Hp

Employment Type
Intern

Duration of employment
6 months

Industry
Computer hardware

Job Location
Linthicum Heights, Maryland, USA,
21061, Linthicum Heights,
Maryland, USA

Working Hours
8

Base Salary
10

Date posted
September 16, 2024

Valid through
30.04.2026
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To learn more about the HP Print High School Internship Program and to apply, visit
the HP website or contact the program coordinator at [insert contact information
here]. Applications are due by [insert deadline date]. Don’t miss this exciting
opportunity to kick-start your career in technology!
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